
 
APPLICATIONS DETERMINED BY DELEGATED POWERS 

 
 

APP NO. 
DATE REC’D 

NAME AND 
ADDRESS OF 
APPLICANT(S) 

PROPOSAL & LOCATION 
 

DECISION 
 

18/0587/FULL 
29.06.2018 

Ms H Roberts 
9 Coronation Terrace 
Rhymney 
NP22 5EX 

Erect a first floor rear extension 
9 Coronation Terrace Rhymney 
Tredegar NP22 5EX 

Granted 
31.08.2018 
 

18/0577/RET 
27.06.2018 

Euro Garages 
C/o Alistair Flatman 
Planning 
Mr A Flatman 
24 West End Grove 
Horsforth 
Leeds 
LS18 5JJ 

Retain and complete the 
erection of a single storey rear 
extension 
Chequered Flag Petrol Station 
Newport Road Trethomas 
Caerphilly 

Granted 
03.09.2018 
 

18/0610/FULL 
06.07.2018 

Mrs S Williams 
63 Pontygwindy 
Road 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3HD 

Construct driveway to front of 
property including dropped 
kerbs 
63 Pontygwindy Road 
Caerphilly CF83 3HD  

Granted 
03.09.2018 
 

18/0618/COU 
09.07.2018 

Mr B Singh 
35 High Street 
Rhymney 
Tredegar 
NP22 5LP 

Convert shop into one bedroom 
flat 
37 High Street Rhymney 
Tredegar NP22 5LP 

Granted 
03.09.2018 
 

17/1057/FULL 
07.12.2017 

Mr & Mrs C Branfield 
Lawns Lodge 
New Market Street 
Usk 
NP15 1RG 

Change the use of existing 
barn to residential dwelling 
Barn At Argoed Fawr Farm 
Argoed Fawr Farm Lane 
Argoed 

Granted 
04.09.2018 
 

18/0585/FULL 
29.06.2018 

Mr I Corfield 
74 Heol Ysgubor 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1SR 

Erect single storey rear 
extension 
74 Heol Ysgubor Caerphilly 
CF83 1SR  

Granted 
04.09.2018 
 

18/0606/FULL 
05.07.2018 

Mr A Bir 
The Bank House  
5 James Street 
New Tredegar 
NP24 6EW 

Erect side and integral garage, 
new front door and modification 
to front pavement 
The Bank House  5 James 
Street New Tredegar NP24 
6EW 

Refused 
04.09.2018 
 



 
18/0607/TPO 
05.07.2018 

Mr J Davis 
Brynheulog 
Bungalow 
9 Old Parish Road 
Hengoed 
CF82 7HU 
 

Pollard two lime trees to 
prolong life and let more light 
into garden (TPO. No. 
36/79/RVDC) 
Brynheulog Bungalow 9 Old 
Parish Road Hengoed CF82 
7HU 

Granted 
04.09.2018 
 

18/0622/CLPU 
10.07.2018 

Mr A Chedzoy 
4 Druids Close 
Caerphilly 
CF83 2XR 

Obtain a Lawful Development 
Certificate for a proposed 
single-storey rear extension 
4 Druids Close Caerphilly CF83 
2XR  

Refused 
04.09.2018 
 

18/0625/COND 
11.07.2018 

Mr R Lewis 
2 Prince Albert 
Cottages  
Victoria Road  
Fleur De Lis  
CF82 7RE 

Discharge condition 2 - 
Drainage, 6 - Boundary 
Treatments, 8 - Great Crested 
Newt Method Statement & 10 - 
Ground Investigation on 
planning consent 
18/0005/FULL (Erect detached 
house with integral garage) 
Land To The Rear Of 50 
Victoria Road Fleur De Lis 
Blackwood NP12 3UQ 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
04.09.2018 
 

18/0630/FULL 
12.07.2018 

Mr C Davies 
6 Pembroke Court 
Hendredenny 
Caerphilly 
CF83 2TN 
 

Erect a two storey side 
extension and a dormer attic 
conversion 
6 Pembroke Court 
Hendredenny Caerphilly CF83 
2TN 

Granted 
05.09.2018 
 

18/0632/RET 
12.07.2018 

Mr G Nock 
14 Lon Uchaf 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1BR 

Retain rear garden fence 
14 Lon Uchaf Caerphilly CF83 
1BR  

Granted 
05.09.2018 
 

18/0560/FULL 
21.06.2018 

Mr & Mrs L Williams 
41 Maes-Y-Garn 
Road 
Oakdale 
Blackwood 
NP12 0NA 

Erect two storey side extension 
and new vehicle access and 
driveway from highway 
41 Maes-Y-Garn Road Oakdale 
Blackwood NP12 0NA 

Granted 
06.09.2018 
 

18/0604/FULL 
04.07.2018 

Miss F MacFarlane 
83 Ridgeway 
Graig-y-Rhacca 
CF83 8RD 

Erect a two storey side 
extension replacing an existing 
freestanding prefabricated 
garage 
83 Ridgeway Graig-y-rhacca 
Caerphilly CF83 8RD 

Granted 
06.09.2018 
 



 
18/0708/NMA 
09.08.2018 

Mr R Greenhouse 
34 Highfield Road 
Pontllanfraith 
Blackwood 
NP12 2EB 

Seek non-material amendment 
to planning approval 
17/0362/FULL to reduce the 
depth of the garage 
34 Highfield Road Pontllanfraith 
Blackwood NP12 2EB 

Granted 
06.09.2018 
 

18/0713/NMA 
10.08.2018 

Jehu Group Ltd 
C/o GVA 
Mr M Southall 
One Kingsway 
Cardiff 
CF10 3AN 

Seek approval of non material 
amendment to planning 
consent 17/1027/FULL 
(Demolish Caerphilly 
Magistrates' Court building and 
re-develop with 38 No. 
dwellings (comprising 34 No. 
apartments and a terrace of 4 
No. houses), together with 
associated vehicular and 
pedestrian accesses, car 
parking, amenity areas, buggy 
and bin store, landscaping and 
ancillary development: site 
preparation, clearance, 
treatment, re-profiling and the 
installation of new services and 
infrastructure) to replace 
approved external facing brick, 
omit saw tooth panel feature, 
rearrange rear garden of 
terraced houses (block B), omit 
additional support at the base 
of crib-lock retaining wall and 
alter colour of paviours to be 
used in external spaces 
Caerphilly Magistrates Court  
Mountain Road Caerphilly 
CF83 1HG 

Granted 
06.09.2018 
 

18/0549/NCC 
15.06.2018 

Mr A Courtney 
35 Hengoed Road 
Penpedairheol 
Hengoed 
CF82 8BR 
 

Vary condition 2 (Approved 
plans) on planning consent 
16/0808/FULL (Demolish 
existing garage and construct 
one new dwelling) 
Beechwood 35A Hengoed 
Road Penpedairheol Hengoed 

Granted 
07.09.2018 
 



 
18/0629/NCC 
12.07.2018 

Mr & Mrs L Coleman 
41 Maesycoed 
Terrace 
Tredomen 
Hengoed 
CF82 7BU 
 

Vary condition 02 of planning 
consent 17/1018/FULL  (Erect 
two-storey extension to rear of 
dwelling) to increase the height 
of extension and roof pitch on 
gable increased to reflect 
existing  
41 Maesycoed Terrace 
Tredomen Hengoed CF82 7BU 

Granted 
07.09.2018 
 

18/0517/CLPU 
05.06.2018 

Bergstrom (Europe) 
Ltd 
Mr M Bond 
Units C1 To C5  
Dyffryn Park  
Alder Avenue  
Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed 
CF82 7TW 
 

Obtain a Lawful Development 
Certificate for the proposed 
installation of a powder coating 
plant in the units which is a 
metal coating process including 
chemical cleaning, heating and 
sparing a coating 
Bergstrom (Europe) Ltd Block 
C - Unit C1-C5 Duffryn Park 1 
Alder Avenue 

Permitted 
Development 
10.09.2018 
 

18/0641/CLPU 
16.07.2018 

Mr & Mrs B O'Hara 
12 Waun Erw 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3QU 
 

Obtain a Lawful Development 
Certificate for proposed 
construction of single storey 
side extension to rear of 
existing garage 
12 Waun Erw Caerphilly CF83 
3QU  

Granted 
10.09.2018 
 

18/0642/FULL 
16.07.2018 

Mr D Holmes 
9 Cae Pandy 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3JP 

Erect first floor side extension 
9 Cae Pandy Caerphilly CF83 
3JP  

Granted 
11.09.2018 
 

18/0675/ADV 
31.07.2018 

EuroGarages Ltd 
C/o Alistair Flatman 
Planning 
24 West End Grove 
Horsforth 
Leeds 
West Yorkshire 
LS18 5JJ 

Erect replacement totem sign 
Chequered Flag Petrol Station 
Newport Road Trethomas 
Caerphilly 

Granted 
11.09.2018 
 

18/0152/FULL 
13.02.2018 

Millbrook Homes 
(Cwmbran) Limited 
Mr C Rabaiotti 
C/o The Potters 
22-24 Upper Dock 
Street 
Newport 
NP20 1DL 

Demolish existing 
house/associated structures 
and erect eight dwellings and 
associated works 
Gelli Pystyll Farm Elm Drive Ty 
Sign Risca 

Granted 
12.09.2018 
 



 
18/0385/FULL 
30.04.2018 

Convatec Ltd 
Mr J Deal 
Unit 1 - 2 
Heads Of The 
Valleys Industrial 
Estate 
Rhymney 
Tredegar 
NP22 5RL 

Erect two storey storage 
building 
Convatec Ltd Unit 1 - 2 Heads 
Of The Valleys Industrial Estate 
Rhymney 

Granted 
12.09.2018 
 

18/0581/RET 
28.06.2018 

Mr W Wood 
50 Caerphilly Road  
Senghenydd  
Caerphilly  
CF83 4FU 

Retain and complete the 
erection of lock up garage for 
storage 
Land To The Rear Of  4 
Windsor Place Senghenydd  

Granted 
12.09.2018 
 

18/0592/RET 
02.07.2018 

Miss A Partis 
11 Railway Terrace  
Gilfach  
Bargoed  
CF81 8JJ 

Retain raised patio area to rear 
11 Railway Terrace Gilfach 
Bargoed CF81 8JJ 

Granted 
12.09.2018 
 

18/0721/NMA 
14.08.2018 

Caerphilly County 
Borough Council 
Mrs M Bower 
Ty Penallta 
Tredomen Business 
Park 
Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed 
CF82 7PG 

Seek non material amendment 
to planning consent 17/0968/LA 
(Demolish 11 garages and 
construct 10 sectional pre-cast 
garages on the existing slabs) 
to construct 8 garages in 
amended positions 
Garage Site Bedwellty Road To 
Addison Street North Cefn 
Fforest  

Granted 
12.09.2018 
 

18/0599/FULL 
04.07.2018 

Mr & Mrs N Carter 
15 Heolddu Crescent 
Bargoed 
CF81 8UQ 

Erect two storey side extension 
15 Heolddu Crescent Bargoed 
CF81 8UQ  

Granted 
13.09.2018 
 

18/0612/NCC 
09.07.2018 

Mr & Mrs Hutton 
37 Priorsgate 
Oakdale 
Blackwood 
NP12 0EL 
 

Vary condition (2) of Planning 
consent 16/1094/FULL 
(Erection of part single storey, 
part two storey side extension) 
to amend elevation at first floor 
level to be flush with the 
existing elevation, with the side 
and front elevation to be all 
brick to match existing in lieu of 
the render 
37 Priorsgate Oakdale 
Blackwood NP12 0EL 

Granted 
13.09.2018 
 



 
18/0644/COND 
17.07.2018 

Mr Karabar 
17 Ty Gwyn Lane 
Aberbargoed 
Bargoed 
CF81 9AN 
 

Discharge Conditions 1 
(drawings), 2 (means of 
access), 3 (vehicular driveway), 
4 (garage), 6 (gates), 7 
(drainage) and 8 (surface water 
run-off) of planning consent 
14/0130/RM (Seek approval of 
the reserved matters regarding 
appearance, layout and scale 
in connection with the 
residential development 
approved under planning 
application P/06/0671) 
17 Lon Ty Gwyn  Aberbargoed 
Bargoed CF81 9AN 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
17.09.2018 
 

18/0647/FULL 
19.07.2018 

Mr C Matthews 
91 Bryncelyn 
Nelson 
Treharris 
CF46 6HL 

Erect double-storey side 
extension, single-storey rear 
extension, front porch along 
with rear garage 
91 Bryncelyn Nelson Treharris 
CF46 6HL 

Refused 
17.09.2018 
 

18/0656/RET 
24.07.2018 

Mr Brinkworth 
3 Glenview Rise 
Pentwyn-mawr 
Newport 
NP11 4HZ 

Retain garden decking area 
3 Glenview Rise Pentwyn-
mawr Newport NP11 4HZ 

Granted 
17.09.2018 
 

18/0661/COU 
24.07.2018 

Mr N Panayi 
217 High Street 
Blackwood 
NP12 1AL 

Change of use of first floor and 
basement of property to 2 No 
self-contained one bedroom 
flats with associated works and 
retain commercial use at 
ground floor level 
217 High Street Blackwood 
NP12 1AL  

Granted 
17.09.2018 
 

18/0519/FULL 
06.06.2018 

Mr & Mrs Jenkins 
32 Cader Idris Close 
Trenewydd Park 
Risca 
Newport 
NP11 6RP 

Demolish garage and erect part 
two storey, part single storey 
side extension and associated 
alterations 
32 Cader Idris Close 
Trenewydd Park Risca Newport 

Granted 
18.09.2018 
 

18/0608/FULL 
05.07.2018 

Mr G Bishop 
The Haven 
21 Heol Pwllypant 
Energlyn 
Caerphilly 
CF83 2ND 
 

Remove garage and erect a 
single storey side extension 
with habitable area in roof 
space, hip to gable roof 
alteration 
The Haven 21 Heol Pwllypant 
Energlyn Caerphilly 

Granted 
18.09.2018 
 



 
18/0611/COND 
06.07.2018 

Constantine Wind 
Energy 
River Court  
Mill Lane 
Godalming 
GU7 1EZ 
 

Discharge condition 17 (Traffic 
Management Plan) and 18 
(Highway Condition Survey) of 
planning consent 18/0163/NCC 
(Vary condition 12 (Approved 
plans) of planning consent 
15/0774/FULL (Erect a single 
turbine up to a blade tip height 
of 76.45m, 50.0m hub height, 
52.9m rotor diameter and 
output of 800kW with 
associated track access, 
electric cabinet and crane pad) 
to install a different model of 
wind turbine to that which was 
originally approved) 
Land At Tyle Crwth South West 
Of Ynysddu Newport  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
18.09.2018 
 

18/0636/RET 
13.07.2018 

Right From The Start 
Ms C Loring 
Unit B 
31/33 High Street 
Bargoed 
CF81 3RB 

Retain change of use from 
shop (A1) to Community Hub 
and offices (D1) 
Shop Unit B 31-33 High Street 
Bargoed CF81 8RB 

Granted 
18.09.2018 
 

18/0595/COND 
03.07.2018 

Llanover Estate 
Mr M Lennon 
23A Gold Tops 
Newport 
NP20 4UL 

Discharge conditions 05 
(ground investigation) and 9 
(land drainage) of planning 
consent 16/0801/OUT (Erect 
five self-build domestic plots 
with shared private drive for 
onsite turning of service, 
delivery and emergency 
vehicles) 
Newbridge Clinic Ashfield Road 
Newbridge Newport 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
19.09.2018 
 

18/0646/NCC 
17.07.2018 

Mrs C Diamond-
Smith 
5 Pant Glas View 
Trethomas 
Caerphilly 
CF83 8BL 
 

Vary condition 2 of planning 
consent 17/0506/FULL 
(Convert basement to flat, 
provide a new step access to 
basement flat from street level 
and remove internal staircase 
from basement to ground floor) 
to remove front access and 
amend the internal layout 
70 /72 Gladstone Street 
Crosskeys Newport NP11 7PL 

Refused 
19.09.2018 
 



 
18/0660/COND 
26.07.2018 

Mrs N Watkins 
Ty Tallis 
13 Penrhiw Terrace 
Oakdale 
Blackwood 
NP12 0JH 

Discharge condition 02 
(Condition Colour) of planning 
consent 18/0410/LBC 
(Reinstate entrance gates) 
Ty Tallis 13 Penrhiw Terrace 
Oakdale Blackwood 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
19.09.2018 
 

18/0663/COND 
26.07.2018 

GHR Developments 
C/O CLC 
The Design Office 
19 Heol Y Deri 
Rhiwbina  
Cardiff 
CF14 6HA 

Discharge condition 03 
(Drainage) of planning consent 
17/0527/FULL (Construct four 
detached dwellings and 
external works) 
Land Within The Curtilage Of 
Mountain House 41 Mountain 
Road Caerphilly 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
19.09.2018 
 

18/0664/FULL 
26.07.2018 

Mr A Walsh 
49 Gelligaer Road 
Cefn Hengoed 
Hengoed 
CF82 7HH 

Erect two storey side extension 
49 Gelligaer Road Cefn 
Hengoed Hengoed CF82 7HH 

Granted 
19.09.2018 
 

18/0739/NMA 
22.08.2018 

Mrs C Barry 
5 Rhos Y Dderwen 
Blackwood 
NP12 1HB 

Seek approval of a non 
material amendment to 
planning consent 
18/0236/FULL (to amend the 
rear extension doors to uPVC 
glazed patio doors, and to 
reduce the amount of glazing 
panels on the rear and side 
elevation) 
5 Rhos Y Dderwen Blackwood 
NP12 1HB  

Granted 
19.09.2018 
 

18/0453/RET 
14.05.2018 

Mr C Aguiar 
153 Commercial 
Street 
Senghenydd 
Caerphilly 
CF83 4GA 

Retain existing garage with 
proposed extension to side 
Land Rear Of 153 Commercial 
Street Senghenydd Caerphilly 

Granted 
20.09.2018 
 

18/0628/FULL 
11.07.2018 

G B Engineering 
Wales Ltd 
Unit F 
Croespenmaen 
Industrial Estate 
Kendon  
Newport 
NP11 3AG 

Erect Class B2/B8 (General 
Industrial, Storage and 
Distribution) unit together with 
associated servicing, parking 
and new access arrangements 
Land Adj To Unit 2 Parkway 
Penyfan Industrial Estate Pen-
y-fan 

Granted 
20.09.2018 
 



 
18/0653/FULL 
24.07.2018 

Mr & Mrs Stevens 
Ty'r Glan Yr Afon  
Bowls Lane 
Penyrheol 
Caerphilly 
CF83 2TW 

Extend existing single storey 
side extension to a two storey 
extension 
Ty'r Glan Yr Afon  Bowls Lane 
Penyrheol Caerphilly 

Granted 
20.09.2018 
 

18/0107/COND 
31.01.2018 

Persimmon Homes 
East Wales 
Mr J Price 
Llantrisant Business 
Park 
Llantrisant 
CF72 8YP 

Discharge condition 17 
(Affordable Housing) of 
planning application 
15/0567/OUT (granted on 
appeal reference 
APP/K6920/A/16/3160200 - 
Residential development of up 
to 175 units including open 
space provision, access and 
parking arrangements) 
Land At Oakdale Golf Course 
Oakdale Golf Course Lane 
Oakdale Blackwood 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
21.09.2018 
 

18/0497/COU 
29.05.2018 

Mr Hosseini 
24 Oxwich Close 
Cefn Hengoed 
Hengoed 
CF82 7JB 

Change the use from petrol 
station to car washing facility 
Rhymney Garage Victoria 
Road Rhymney Tredegar 

Refused 
21.09.2018 
 

18/0550/COU 
12.06.2018 

Mr L Canning 
30 Britannia Terrace  
Britannia  
Pengam 
NP12 3TE 

Demolish existing rear garage, 
and replace with an outbuilding 
consisting of two music rooms 
with small waiting area and 
inside toilet, for Business Use 
30 Britannia Terrace Britannia 
Blackwood NP12 3TE 

Granted 
21.09.2018 
 

18/0576/COND 
27.06.2018 

Mrs S Fletcher 
20 Parc Bryn 
Pontllanfraith 
Blackwood 
NP12 2RA 

Discharge conditions 02 
(access and materials)  and 03 
(parking) of planning consent 
18/0036/COU (Convert existing 
commercial property into a 
residential dwelling) 
15 Woodbine Road Blackwood 
NP12 1QF  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
21.09.2018 
 



 
18/0667/NCC 
27.07.2018 

Wasp Utility Services 
Ltd 
Mr W Pugh 
73 Pen Y Cwm 
Abertysswg 
Rhymney 
Tredegar 
NP22 5AD 

Vary condition 01 of planning 
consent 12/0701/FULL (Erect 
detached four bedroom 
dwelling) allowed on appeal 
APP/K6920/A/13/2198622 to 
extend the period of time for 
development commencement 
Land At Grid Ref 313509 
205524 McLaren Cottages 
Abertysswg  

Granted 
21.09.2018 
 

18/0583/FULL 
28.06.2018 

Mrs G Fitzpatrick 
58 Central Avenue  
Newbridge  
Blackwood  
NP11 5GD 

Erect a porch extension to front 
of property 
58 Central Avenue Pantside 
Newport NP11 5GD 

Granted 
24.09.2018 
 

18/0645/FULL 
16.07.2018 

Mr S Thomas 
Venice House 
Merchant Street 
Pontlottyn 
Bargoed 
CF81 9QZ 

Erect rear extension with partial 
covered decking area and alter 
other elevations 
5 Pen-Y-Cwm Abertysswg 
Tredegar NP22 5AD 

Granted 
24.09.2018 
 

18/0699/COND 
06.08.2018 

Llanmoor 
Developments Ltd 
Mr S Grey 
63-65 Talbot Road 
Talbot Green 
Pontyclun 
CF72 8AE 
 

Discharge Conditions 10  
(detailed scheme) and 12 (light 
mitigation strategy) of planning 
consent 15/0038/OUT allowed 
on appeal 
APP/K6920/A/15/3136679 
(Erect residential development 
with associated public open 
space, landscaping and 
highways infrastructure 
including a new highway 
access from Pandy Road and 
footpaths and requiring the 
installation of new services and 
infrastructure and other 
ancillary works and activities) 
Land At Grid Ref 315897 
189288 Pandy Road Bedwas  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
24.09.2018 
 



 
18/0730/COND 
20.08.2018 

Llanmoor 
Development 
Company Ltd 
Mr S Grey 
63-65 Talbot Road 
Talbot Green 
Pontyclun 
Rhondda Cynon Taff 
CF72 8AE 
 

Discharge Condition 3 of 
planning consent 18/0440/RM 
(Seek approval of the reserved 
matters regarding details of 
access, appearance, 
landscaping, layout and scale 
in relation to planning consent 
granted on appeal reference 
APP/K6920/A/15/3136679 
(LPA reference 15/0038/OUT - 
Erect residential development 
with associated public open 
space, landscaping and 
highways infrastructure 
including a new highway 
access from Pandy Road and 
footpaths and requiring the 
installation of new services and 
infrastructure and other 
ancillary works and activities) to 
construct 240 residential units 
and associated engineering 
works) 
Land At Grid Ref 315897 
189288 Pandy Road Bedwas  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
24.09.2018 
 

18/0649/RET 
20.07.2018 

Mrs P Flanagan 
Twyn House 
The Row To Pont Y 
Draethen 
Draethen 
NP10 8GA 

Retain works undertaken by 
planning consent 
12/0886/FULL and complete 
development in accordance 
with amended details 
Twyn House The Row To Pont 
Y Draethen Draethen Newport 

Granted 
25.09.2018 
 

18/0652/CLEU 
23.07.2018 

Mrs C Howells 
Cwm Farm 
Rudry Road To Craig 
Llan 
Rudry 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3EB 

Obtain Certificate of 
Lawfulness to regularise the 
extant consent 12/0325/FULL 
for barn conversion 
Cwm Farm Rudry Road To 
Craig Llan Rudry Caerphilly 

Granted 
25.09.2018 
 

18/0658/RET 
24.07.2018 

Mr & Mrs R Bullock 
4 Virginia View 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3JA 
 

Retain single storey extension 
for new bedroom and en-
suite/wet room 
4 Virginia View Caerphilly CF83 
3JA  

Granted 
25.09.2018 
 



 
18/0682/FULL 
02.08.2018 

Mrs L Krizan 
5 Ynys-Glyd Street 
Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed 
CF82 7ET 

Erect two storey rear extension 
5 Ynys-Glyd Street Ystrad 
Mynach Hengoed CF82 7ET 

Refused 
25.09.2018 
 

18/0685/FULL 
02.08.2018 

Mr C Arcos 
Ty Cilgant 
30C The Crescent 
Machen 
Caerphilly 
CF83 8ND 

Erect single storey extension to 
front elevation 
Ty Cilgant 30C The Crescent 
Machen Caerphilly 

Granted 
25.09.2018 
 

18/0181/RET 
23.02.2018 

Mr D Parsons 
76 Heol Uchaf 
Rhiwbina 
Cardiff 
CF14 9SR 

Retain and complete works to 
roof to change from hip to 
gable and external alterations 
Mapledene 10 Dan-y-coed 
Caerphilly CF83 1HU 

Granted 
26.09.2018 
 

18/0224/COND 
08.03.2018 

Constantine Wind 
Energy 
River Court 
Mill Lane 
Godalming 
GU7 1EZ 
 

Discharge conditions 5 (habitat 
management and mitigation 
plan), 7 (land drainage), 13 
(shadow flicker mitigation 
protocol), 14 (MOD), 15 
(finishes/colour of wind turbine) 
and 16 (archaeological brief) of 
planning consent 18/0163/NCC 
(Vary condition 12 (Approved 
plans) of planning consent 
15/0774/FULL (Erect a single 
turbine up to a blade tip height 
of 76.45m, 50.0m hub height, 
52.9m rotor diameter and 
output of 800kW with 
associated track access, 
electric cabinet and crane pad) 
to install a different model of 
wind turbine to that which was 
originally approved) 
Land At Tyle Crwth  South 
West Of Ynysddu Newport  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
26.09.2018 
 



 
18/0413/COND 
04.05.2018 

Kingfisher 
Developments Ltd 
(Wales) 
Mr A Ely 
The Hayes Building 
Burial Lane 
Town Hall Square 
Llantwit Major 
Vale Of Glamorgan 
CF61 1SD 
 

Discharge conditions 02 
(drainage), 03 (contamination), 
08 (landscaping), 09 
(construction - structural calcs), 
10 (biodiversity method 
statement), 12 (dormice 
survey), 13 (reptile clearance 
method statement), 15 
(biodiversity 
mitigation/enhancement) and 
16 (construction - engineering 
details) of planning consent 
16/0628/FULL (Erect nine 
bungalows and associated 
works) 
Land At Grid Ref 312939 
201547 Riverside Walk Deri  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
26.09.2018 
 

18/0567/COND 
25.06.2018 

Kingfisher 
Development Ltd 
(Wales) 
Mr A Ely 
The Hayes Building 
Town Hall Square 
Llantwit Major 
CF61 1SD 
 

Discharge conditions 6 
(Materials), 11 (Tree 
Protection) and 14 (Japanese 
Knotweed) of planning 
application 16/0628/FULL 
(Erect nine bungalows and 
associated works) 
Land At Grid Ref 312939 
201547 Riverside Walk Deri  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
26.09.2018 
 

18/0623/COND 
06.07.2018 

Ms Tallon &  Mr Cole 
Van Mansion 
Gwern-y-domen 
Farm Lane 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3RN 

Discharge conditions 5 (TPO), 
9 (vehicle passing facilities), 10 
(drainage) and 15 (external 
lighting) of planning consent 
17/0818/COU (Carry out 
extensive repair and 
refurbishment (both external 
and internal), internal 
rearrangement and upgrade 
works for continued use as a 
dwelling and proposed use as a 
B&B facility) 
Van Mansion Gwern-y-domen 
Farm Lane Caerphilly CF83 
3RN 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
26.09.2018 
 

18/0662/CLPU 
26.07.2018 

Miss S Brake 
45 Penybryn Terrace 
Penybryn 
Hengoed 
CF82 7GG 

Erect single storey rear 
extension to enlarge lounge 
and kitchen areas 
45 Penybryn Terrace Penybryn 
Hengoed CF82 7GG 

Granted 
26.09.2018 
 



 
18/0718/COND 
14.08.2018 

Mr & Mrs R Belbin 
The Cottage 
Baden Hill 
Tytherineton 
Wotten Under Edge 
EL12 8PY 

Discharge Condition 04 - 
Archaeological Brief of 
Application No 13/0228/CON 
(Demolish stone store) 
Plot Adjacent To Twyn House 
Draethen Newport  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
26.09.2018 
 

18/0614/LBC 
09.07.2018 

Mr G Evans-Jones 
13 Collins Row 
Butetown 
Rhymney 
Tredegar 
NP22 5QL 

Erect detached garage 
13 Collins' Row Bute Town 
Rhymney Tredegar 

Granted 
27.09.2018 
 

 
 
 
 


